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1.0 CHALLENGE 
 
The city has recognized that change is happening. Population growth has slowed 
compared to previous years. Residents are aging, a challenge faced not only in Mount 
Pearl but across the province. Economic and business activity has wavered with industry 
trends. The city’s new long-term Economic Development Strategy focuses on both 
resident attraction and economic sector growth. To capitalize on these opportunities, the 
city must continuously communicate a consistent value proposition to expand and retain 
businesses and attract newcomers to the city. The city’s Strategic Plan also focuses on 
the development and redevelopment of public and private key areas to support new 
housing development, create a destination throughout the city centre, and provide more 
amenities and offerings to residents and newcomers. Resident attraction and immigration 
rank high on the province’s policy priorities. This provides an opportunity for Mount Pearl 
to promote its quality of life, community amenities, and strategic location where all are 
welcomed to explore opportunities where they can Come To Life. 

 
 

2.0 PURPOSE AND STRATEGY 
 

“There’s something about our rhythm here. Life can be as fast, or as slow, as you’d like. 
Whether you embrace the hustle and bustle, or you’re drawn to kicking back and taking it 
all in, Mount Pearl has something suited to match your vibe. 
 
Slow down and take a breath. Amidst natural beauty and charming neighbourhoods lies a 
beautiful network of scenic trails, playgrounds, and friendly faces. Or ramp it up. Take part 
in our world-class community events, reach adventure, or go for a night on the town. 
 
Life is what you make it, and in Mount Pearl, you can choose your own path. 
 
Step into a welcoming community that celebrates diversity and inclusivity. Mount Pearl is 
more than just a city; it’s a close-knit family where everyone belongs. 
 
Come to Play. Come to Learn. Come to Roam. Come to Stay. Come to Life in Mount 
Pearl.” 
 
The messaging and aura in this new wesbite delivers on our objective: To promote Mount 
Pearl as a vibrant, exciting, and attractive place to live, work, and do business. The goal is 
to attract immigrants, residents, and young families to choose Mount Pearl as a place to 
lay down roots and thrive in a welcoming, engaging, and prosperous community filled with 
opportunities. The intent is to also attract investors, developers, and entrepreneurs to 
choose Mount Pearl as a place to invest and start a business. 
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3.0 TARGET AUDIENCE 
 

The target audience for this project is residents, visitors, tourists, immigrants, and 
investors. Not only does this advertising campaign aim to attract new residents and create 
a tourist destination within the city, but it also sparks opportunities for entrepreneurs, 
business owners, and investors to develop, invest, and redevelop areas that have the 
Come To Life potential. 

 
 

4.0 PLAN & EXECUTION 
 

When somebody is looking for a new place to live or start a business, they naturally have 
lots of questions – about services, programs, amenities, quality of life, infrastructure, 
permitting, taxes, growth, and how involved the city will be in their new life. The Come To 
Life campaign aims to answer all of these questions. It speaks to the ‘welcoming’, 
‘opportunistic’ and ‘get it done’ attitude, flexibility, and exceptional sense of community 
unique to Mount Pearl.  
 
The fully integrated campaign, complete with the innovative interactive website 
(https://cometolife.mountpearl.ca/), communicated this message to new residents, 
business owners, and investors through awareness-building media: videos (launch video, 
pre-roll videos, and testimonial videos), radio ads, print ads, animated online ads, a social 
media campaign, a launch in the Pearl Pulse, and new city-wide flag pole banners. 
 
The website is unique in design, innovative, and extremely user-friendly, which aligns with 
our “business friendly” and “innovative” approach. All program and service details, 
statistics, demographic and community information can be easily accessed on the site 
and/or directed to the appropriate platforms for further detail. 

 
 

5.0 EFFECTIVENESS/MEETING OBJECTIVES 
 

The Come To Life campaign and website have already made a significant impact in our 
community, region, and beyond. Not only does it articulate the inclusive mindset and 
forward-thinking practices, it also delivered tangible results: 

• Over 670,000 impressions on digital display ads  

• Over 275,000 impressions on Facebook ads with a 2.035% CTR 

• 50,000 impressions on CTV Campaign with 98.46% video completion rate 

• 56,506 completed views on YouTube campaign ads 

• Over 36,000 website page views 

• Over 10 new Housing Development Applications received totalling over 250 units 

• 6 Development Permits issued for 161 new housing units 

• This is the first year Mount Pearl has seen a significant rise in population growth 
and are projecting an 8% increase by 2027.  

• 48 Business Occupancy Permits issued already in 2024. 44 issued in 2023. 

https://cometolife.mountpearl.ca/
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• Over 25 inquires for housing development projects in 2024. 

• Over 30 inquires for business opportunities in 2024. 
 
The Come to Life Campaign also compliments the city’s Find Your Centre – City Centre 
Renewal Plan, a 25-year long plan to redevelop the city centre, which when fully realized, 
has the potential to deliver over 3,700 jobs and generate $375 million in GDP. It is also 
expected to generate $270 million in total household income and $109 million in total 
government tax revenue. 

 
6.0 SUPPORTING DOCUMENTATION 
 

• Come To Life Landing Page 

• Come To Life Launch Video 

• Come To Life Testimonial Video – Best Kind BBQ 

• Come To Life Testimonial Video – GolfShotz  

• Come To Life Oktoberfest Video 

• Come To Life Frosty Festival Video  

• City of Mount Pearl Facebook Page 

• Pearl Pulse – Mount Pearl City Guide 

• Find Your Centre – Mount Pearl City Centre Renewal Plan 
 
OneDrive link includes the photos, videos, graphics, media clippings, and other related 
material: EDAC Award Submission - Come To Life Campaign 
 

https://findyourcentre.ca/
https://findyourcentre.ca/
https://cometolife.mountpearl.ca/
https://youtu.be/b-y4AUUqd44?si=C-ea2euTSQhcTrUk
https://youtu.be/XUo4bAgaFkA?si=S6S-AfmTst1C3DQo
https://youtu.be/N1kRN4C9t6o?si=keZJpYCTP9zqMI0V
https://youtu.be/S4DuGWUvrdg?si=ATVk9ZuEaeQha6QV
https://youtu.be/ZKf2_iP3ZxA?si=tF92WdwXrLG1QQ5l
https://www.facebook.com/mountpearl
https://www.mountpearl.ca/residents/pearlpulse/
https://findyourcentre.ca/wp-content/uploads/FYC_MP_May2021.pdf
https://cityofmountpearl-my.sharepoint.com/:f:/g/personal/jschwartz_mountpearl_ca/EgHxGFJ3cqJCiqUlUU81MLoBglnWktvnA4PE3ZXTfwOa3g?e=8qjOfD

